BID TABULATION

ITB No:

63-22 ""Picnic Tables"

Harriett Bell, Principal Buyer
bellh@jccal.org

Item No. Description Est Qty BSN SPORTS LLC QUALITY SPECIALTY PRODUCTS CONSERV COMPANY BLISS PRODUCTS AND SERVICES, INC. TERRELL ENTERPRISES, INC. GLOBAL EQUIPMENT COMPNAY, INC.
PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE PRICE EXT. PRICE
ULINE Model Number H-2560 46 Hex Size 72 x 50
72 x 307as specified or approved equal. $927.84 $46,392.00 $1,029.00 $51,450.00 $1,025.00 $51,250.00 $1,200.00 $60,000.00 $1,604.00 $80,200.00 $1,607.81 $80,390.50
1 List available colors! Cedar, Gray, Green See Catalog Cedar, Green Grey
The Parks Facilities, 289-4005
Manufacturer & Number: FROG Hex Table, PB 6HEX Albatross, ATB121 (6" Hexagonal Recycled Plastic Picnic Table UltraSite, 26-HEX-CDR UltraSite, 26-HEX-CDR Global Industrial - B264040
ADA MODEL , ULINE Model Number H-2560 46
Hex Size 72 x 72 x 30” as specified or approved 2
equal $927.84 $1,855.68 $1,029.00 $2,058.00 $1,010.00 $2,020.00 $1,485.00 $2,970.00 No Bid No Bid $1,535.94 3071.88
2 List available colors! Cedar, Gray, Green See Catalog Cedar, Green, Grey
The Parks Facilities, 289-4005
Manufacturer & Number FROG Hex ADA Table, PB 6HEXADA Albatross, ATB121 ADA 6' Hexagonal Recycled ADA Plastic Picnic Table UltraSite, P358h-R48 UltraSite,26H-HEX-CDR Global Industrial - B264043
MOUNTING HARDWARE Tales have holes to mount to
3 concretg, but bolts and hardware No Bid
are not included. FOB
Destintation Included $32.00 $1,664.00 No Bid No Bid Included $42.95 - Item# B264296 $2,233.40
ULINE Model Number H-2127 46” Round 81 x 81 x 10
. 30 2" Picnic table as specified or approved equal $1,140.22 $11,402.20 $935.00 $9,350.00 $1,298.00 $12,980.00 $1,045.00 $10,450.00 $1,397.00 $13,970.00 $870.57 $8,705.70
List available colors: Black, Brown, Red, Green, Dark Blue, Burgundy, Blue, Beige See Catalog Black, Blue, Green, Red, Grey
The Parks Facilities, 543-6010
Manufacturer & Number UltraSite 358-RDV (46" Round Table Diamond) Albatross, A01241 46-In Round Picnic Table UltraSite, P358-RDV UltraSite, P358-RDV Global Industrial - B277150GN
ADA MODEL , ULINE Model Number H-2127 46
Round 81 x 81 x 30 }2” Picnic table as specified or 2
5 approved equal. $1,140.22 $2,280.44 $935.00 $1,870.00 $1,190.00 $2,380.00 $995.00 $1,990.00 $1,331.00 $2,662.00 $1,393.75 $2,787.50
List available colors: Black, Brown, Red, Green, Dark Blue, Burgundy, Blue, Beige See Catalog Black, Blue, Green, Red, Grey
The Parks Facilities, 543-6011
Manufacturer & Number UltraSite 358h-RDV (3-seat, 46" Round Ada Table Diamond) Albatross, A01241 ADA 46-In Round Picnic Table UltraSite, P358H-RDV UltraSite, P358H-RDV Global Industrial - B246753
MOUNTING HARDWARE Tales have holes to mount to
concrete, but bolts and hardware . Included
6 are not included. FOB No Bid nelude
Destintation $38.00 $456.00 No Bid No Bid Included $15.99 - ltem# 652776 191.88
Grand Total Itmes 1-6 $4,136.12 $61,930.32 $3,928.00 $64,728.00 $4,523.00 $70,750.00 $4,725.00 $75,410.00 $4,332.00 $96,832.00 $5,408.07 $97,380.86
Freight is not included
and will be calculated
based on where in Prices include a 22% material
FOB Destination - Prices do not include Central Alabama the surcharge. Includes delivery and
Delivery is guaranteed not later than days after order date. 15-20 days inside deliver or installation 60 days 120 days 120 days tables ship 120 days installation 7-10 days
Guaranteed maximum discount available if contract is renewed for 2nd year 0% 5% 0% 0% 5% 0%
Guaranteed maximum discount available if contract is renewed for 3rd year 0% 5% 0% 0% 5% 0%
REQUIRED FORMS
NOTIFICATION OF INTENT TO RESPOND v v v v N N
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT V V V N N N
AFFIDAVIT OF CONTRACTOR V V V N N N
EEOC v v v i i v
DEBARMENT STATEMENT V v V N N N
SIGNATURE PAGE V V V N N N
PACA COVERSHEET N V V v N N

CONTACT INFORMATION:
BSN SPORTS, LLC | 14460 Varsity Brands Way Farmers Branch, TX 7524 | Contact: Cade Fowler | Ph:800-527-7510| Email: bsnbid@bsnsports.com

Quality Specialty Products | 1160 East Jericho Tpke, Huntington, NY 11743 | Contact: Matt Delaney | Ph: 631-471-2900 | Email: mattd@qspny.com
ConServ Company | 1003 Illinois St, Sidney, NE 69162 | Contact: Laila Assad | Ph: 308-254-4720 | Email: laila@conservflag.com
Bliss Porducts and Services, Inc. | 6831 S. Sweetwater Rd, Lithia Springs, GA 30122 | Contact: Gregg Bliss | Ph: 800-248-2547 | Email: info@blissproducts.com
TERRELL ENTERPRISES - 106 S CLOVERDALE RD, GREENVILLE, AL 36037 - AL BRANNON, 334-382-7415, AL@TERRELLENTERPRISES.COM
Global Equipment Company | 11 Harbor Park Drive, Port Washington, NY 11050 | Contact: William H. Rose 111 | Phone: 414-302-7559 |
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